
SALVAGE  TABULATION
Specification Number:F3998940018                                                                                                              Date: September 24 , 2003

Project Description: FOR SALE, USED EQUIPMENT

Bid Deposit:                                                                                                        Addendum __1 __2 __3 __4                                               Contract Administrator: J. Picl

NAME OF BIDDER     RICHARD’S
AUTO  SALES 

DERBY HILL
EQUIPMENT

AUTO
WHOLESALERS

VINTAGE
VEHICLES &
PARTS, INC.

AL WITVOET &
SONS

ADELMAN’S
TRUCK PARTS

CORP.

TRUCKS  &
PARTS OF OHIO

ERICKSON
TRUCKS -N-

PARTS

ILLIANA TRUCK
PARTS, INC.

WM. HOEKSTRA
& SONS, INC.

COZZI  IRON  &
METAL, INC.

A & M AUTO

S11301 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $655.00 $718.00 $1,369.00 $1,781.77 $509.03 $577.00 $300.00 $705.00

S11313 X X X X $500.00 $1,061.00 $569.00 $711.77 $509.03 $633.00 $200.00 X

S11314 X X X X $410.00 $1,171.00 $669.00 $831.77 $759.03 $777.00 $210.00 X

S11315 X X X X $525.00 $1,171.00 $569.00 $661.77 $509.03 $710.00 $188.00 X

S11322 X X X X $510.00 X $569.00 $661.77 $509.03 $750.00 $210.00 X

S11328 X X X X $415.00 $863.00 $569.00 $431.77 X $435.00 $150.00 X

S11330 X X X X $375.00 $888.00 $569.00 $531.77 $509.03 $607.00 $190.00 X

S11337 X X X X $425.00 $789.00 $569.00 $661.77 $509.03 $777.00 $205.00 X

S11344 X X X X $385.00 $1,171.00 $569.00 $711.77 $509.03 $757.00 $200.00 X

S11348 X X X X $625.00 $1,209.00 $669.00 $911.77 $509.03 $888.00 $210.00 X

S11349 X X X X $500.00 $1,178.00 $569.00 $661.77 $509.03 $670.00 $190.00 X

S11364 X X X X $610.00 $836.00 $569.00 $661.77 $509.03 $637.00 $176.00 X

S10301 X X X X X $1,867.00 $1,769.00 $2,311.77 $1,509.03 X $506.00 X

S10320 X X X X X $1,617.00 $469.00 $2,161.77 $1,509.03 X $520.00 X

S10328 X X X X X $1,581.00 $2,069.00 $1,781.77 $1,509.03 X $400.00 X

S10423 X X X X X X $169.00 $611.77 $1,509.03 X $81.00 X

S10441 X X X X X $1,376.00 $1,169.00 $2,161.77 $1,259.03 X $220.00 X

S10484 X X X X X $1,233.00 $1,269.00 $1,131.77 $1,009.03 X $200.00 X

S11300 X X X X X $881.00 $169.00 $861.77 $759.03 $600.00 $288.10 $1,106.00

S11303 X X X X $1,275.00 $1,181.00 $1,369.00 $911.77 $759.03 $877.00 $225.00 X

S11304 X X X X $1,850.00 $1,181.00 $169.00 $561.77 $759.03 $840.00 $215.00 $889.00

S11305 X X X X $875.00 $961.00 $1,169.00 $861.77 $759.03 $650.00 $225.00 X

S11308 X X X X $1,155.00 $1,181.00 $1,369.00 $911.77 $759.03 $1,377.00 $225.00 X
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S11312 X X X X $425.00 $888.00 $569.00 $411.77 X $877.00 $150.00 X

S11324 X X X X $975.00 $1,181.00 $1,169.00 $761.77 $759.03 $697.00 $220.00 X

S11332 X X X X $550.00 X $669.00 $611.77 $509.03 $670.00 $188.00 X

S11343 X X X X $610.00 $888.00 $769.00 $861.77 $759.03 $720.00 $222.00 X

S11351 X X X X $450.00 $788.00 $569.00 $411.77 X $927.00 $150.00 X

S11355 X X X X $620.00 $1,171.00 $769.00 $911.77 $759.03 $777.00 $215.00 X

S11359 X X X X $500.00 $901.00 $469.00 $431.77 X $727.00 $176.00 X

S11360 X X X X $435.00 $958.00 $569.00 $461.77 X $697.00 $176.00 X

S11363 X X X X $425.00 $909.00 $569.00 $661.77 $509.03 $817.00 $188.00 X

S11366 X X X $475.00 $1,171.00 $1,169.00 $761.77 $759.03 $888.00 $210.00 X

Bids are subject to review for completeness accuracy and compliance with all the terms and conditions provided in the bid specifications.
City of Chicago   City of Chicago                                                        Department of Procurement                                                     Department of Procurement

ServicesServices
Richard M. Daley, MayorRichard M. Daley, Mayor David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer David E. Malone Chief Procurement Officer 
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